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Quick Startup notes for using the Livescribe Echo Smartpen 

Smartpen Setup 

Display Orientation. Adjust display orientation to accommodate for left or right hand writing 
and display brightness by tapping the appropriate buttons on the inside cover of the notebook 
under the "DISPLAY" section with the tip of the Smartpen.  

Set Date and Time. On the inside cover of the notebook, tap the "set date" button, and then 
tap the numbers to set the correct date.  For example to set the date as May 17, 2016, tap 
051716.  Tap the "set time" button, and then tap the numbers to set the time.  

Record Notes and/or Audio 

Record notes. Turn the Smartpen on and begin writing on the dot paper notebook. 

Record notes and audio. Turn the Smartpen on and touch the tip to the "record" button 
located on the bottom of the dot paper notebook page, then start writing. You can turn the 
audio recording feature on and off while taking notes.   

Record audio. Turn the Smartpen on and touch the tip to the "record" button.  You can also 
turn on the audio recording feature by holding the power button down until you hear the 
recording beep and the Smartpen's screen displays that it is recording. When finished recording 
turn the Smartpen off. 

Download Notes and Audio 

Download and install the free Livescribe Echo Desktop Software to transfer your Smartpen's 
notes and recordings to a computer via USB. When the Smartpen is connected to your 
computer all files will be transferred.   

Listen to Audio Recordings 

1. Touch the tip of the Smartpen to your notes associated with audio and the recording will
play from that particular moment within the recording.

2. Use the control buttons “jump” and “jump to position” buttons located at the bottom of the
notebook page to move through a recording.

3. After downloading the recording to your Livescribe Desktop app, you may use the app's
controls to play the recording.

4. It is possible to export audio only recordings as MP3 files. For further instructions on how to
do so, please refer to the ECHO Smartpen online Detailed User Guide.

Add New Notes to Existing Audio 

1. Touch the tip of the Smartpen to the original notes with audio.
2. Once the audio begins playing, immediately begin writing the new notes you also want

synchronized with the audio.
3. Tap on the new text to play the updated audio recording.

http://www.livescribe.com/en-us/support/echo/setup/
http://www.livescribe.com/en-us/media/pdf/support/Echo_User/Echo_UserGuide.pdf


New Notebooks 

When switching to a new notebook, tap on the Status Label. If it says you are already using a 
notebook with the same number, be sure to archive your old notebook on the Echo Desktop 
software first (see Archive a Notebook section below).  If you own Livescribe notebooks that 
have the same naming and numbering (such as lined notebook 1, lined notebook 2, etc.) use 
them sequentially.  Archive your Livescribe notebooks after you have finished them.   

Archive a Notebook 

Use the Echo Desktop software to archive notebooks.  Archiving a notebook transfers all 


